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Menopause Clinics 

Reference Number:  RDF1342-23 
Date of Response: 28/03/2023 

 
Further to your Freedom of Information Act request, please find the Trust’s 
response(s) below: 
 
Please be aware that the Royal Devon University Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust 
(Royal Devon) has existed since 1st April 2022 following the integration of the Northern 
Devon Healthcare NHS Trust (known as Northern Services) and the Royal Devon and 
Exeter NHS Foundation Trust (known as Eastern Services). 

 
 

1. Please provide me a list of menopause clinics that the trust operates, 
including the address and postcode of the clinic.  

2. What is the mean waiting time between referral and appointment at a 
menopause clinic within the trust area?  

3. How many people are currently on the waiting list for a menopause clinic? 
4. How many referrals have there been to menopause clinics each year since 

2018? Please split the data by calendar year  
 
The Trust can confirm we do not hold the information requested for this FOI, as such we 
are unable to respond to the  above questions. 
 
Although women who are menopausal are seen in the Trust general clinics, the Trust  
does not hold actual menopause clinics . 
 


