
 
 
 
 
 

Page 1 of 1 

Title:  
 Human Albumin 

Reference Number:  RDF2181-24 
Date of Response: 10/01/24 

 
Further to your Freedom of Information Act request, please find the Trust’s 
response(s) below: 
 
 

I would like to submit an FOI request for the amount of human albumin in grams 
purchased by the trust in 2023 (the entire calendar year), 
 
a.     broken down by manufacturer (Bio Products Laboratory, Grifols, Biotest, CSL 
Behring, Octapharma, Takeda), 
b.     by concentration (4.5%, 5%, 20%) and 
c.     by service ordering albumin (ICU, Liver unit, etc.) 
 
Please see Trust response below.  Please note, we can are unable to find any  
orders before April in the East or Northern service.. 
 

Order 
date 

Supplier ID (T) Service Concentration Amount 

13/06/2023 Grifols UK 
Limited 

Blood 
Transfusion 

Not recorded. 18,000g 

13/06/2023 Grifols UK 
Limited 

Blood 
Transfusion 

Not recorded. 17,000g 

14/06/2023 Biotest UK 
Limited 

Blood 
Transfusion 

5% 15,000ml 

28/06/2023 Biotest UK 
Limited 

Blood 
Transfusion 

5% 42,500ml 

20/12/2023 Grifols UK 
Limited 

Blood 
Transfusion 

20% 3000g 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


