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Further to your Freedom of Information Act request, please find the Trust’s response, 
in blue bold text below: 
 
 

Royal Devon’s Eastern FOI Office Response 
 
 
 
1. The number of vasectomy operations your trust has done in the years: 
2021-22  
 
8 vasectomy operations 
 
2020-21 
 
≤5 vasectomy operations 
 
2019-20  
 
6 vasectomy operations 
 
2018-19 
 
20 vasectomy operations 
 
2017-18 
 
24 vasectomy operations 
 
2. The number of vasectomy operations your trust has done that have been 
unsuccessful / failed in the years: 
2021-22 
2020-21 
2019-20 
2018-19 
2017-18 
 
The Trust does not hold this information. 
 
3. The number of vasectomy operations your trust has done that have been redone 
in the years: 
2021-22 
2020-21 
2019-20 
2018-19 
2017-18 



  

 
The Trust does not hold this information. 
 
≤5.  In accordance with section 40 (2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, 
we are unable to provide figures where the number of patients is less than or 
equal to five and could risk the identification of those patients and breach 
Caldicott principles.  
 
 


