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Patient Trolleys / Beds 

Reference Number:  RDF1386-23 
Date of Response: 18/04/2023 

 
Further to your Freedom of Information Act request, please find the Trust’s 
response(s) below: 
 
Please be aware that the Royal Devon University Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust 
(Royal Devon) has existed since 1st April 2022 following the integration of the Northern 
Devon Healthcare NHS Trust (known as Northern Services) and the Royal Devon and 
Exeter NHS Foundation Trust (known as Eastern Services). 
Questions: Northern Eastern 

1. How many patient 
trolleys/stretchers are used/owned 
within RDUH and what make, and 
model are they?  (Please could the 
list be split between all your sites) 

76 held at the Northern 
Service of the Trust. 
8 held Bideford 
Hospital. 

No Information on quantity 
available currently 
 
Make of Trolley / Stretchers 
used: 
Stryker / Anetic Aid  

2. The purchase dates for the list of 
trolleys on question above 

27 purchased 
2020/2021, 10 
purchased 2021/2022, 
8 purchased 2012, 
remaining purchased 
during 2008/2009/2010 
 
 

 
No Information available 
currently.  We are getting very 
varied results from numerous 
suppliers for varied equipment. 
We cannot produce anything 
meaningful for this FOI.  

3. Expected level of spend on patient 
trolleys/stretchers for next 12 
months 

This information is not 
held by the Trust.   

This information is not held by 
the Trust.   

4. How many profiling beds are 
used/owned within RDUH and what 
make, and model are they?  (Please 
could the list be split between all 
your sites) 

Approximately 350.  
330 at the Northern 
Service, and 0 at South 
Molton 
210 x Hillrom 
Avantgarde 1200,  140 
x Hillrom 900 series 

Approximately 900 Beds within 
the Eastern Service of the 
RDUH. And 100 at Community 
Sites 
Bed models to Include: 
- Argo Enterprise – 5000 
- Hillrom - HR900 
- Hillrom – Vulkar 
- Parkhouse – Ultra Low 
- Argo – Contura 
- ITU – Hillrom Total Care 
 
  

5. How many electric bed movers are 
used/owned within RDUH and what 
make, and model are they?  (Please 
could the list be split between all 
your sites) 

2 types 
1 x Power truck not 
sure of model 
1 x CJ Medical, Model 
P4 

No bed movers currently with 
the RDUH 

6. Expected level of spend on electric 
bed movers for next 12 months 

This information is not 
held by the Trust.   

This information is not held by 
the Trust.    

 

 


